
REQUEST FOR BOARD ACTION 
 

HENDERSON COUNTY 
BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS 

 
 
MEETING DATE:   Wednesday, January 18, 2006 
 
SUBJECT: Elections Equipment 
 
ATTACHMENTS:   Yes   

1. Board of Elections Resolution 
2. ES&S Equipment Cost/Financing Estimates 

 
SUMMARY OF REQUEST: 
 
Attached you will find a resolution executed by the Henderson County Board of 
Elections, recommending the purchase of equipment from ES&S.  This company is 
currently the only state certified vendor for voting equipment.  In addition, as 
requested by the Board of Commissioners at your last meeting, our Finance Director 
has provided cost/financing estimates for the equipment being recommended by 
Elections.    
 
As the Board is aware, there has been a lot of reaction from counties across the state 
regarding the implications of Senate Bill 223, Public Confidence in Elections. The bill 
prompted the decertification of all existing voting equipment across the state and in 
the end, allows for only one vendor, ES&S, to now be certified.  Unfortunately, to 
date we have no indication that the General Assembly will indeed convene and delay 
the implementation of the new guidelines.  Therefore, Henderson County is in the 
position of determining whether or not to purchase this new equipment by the 
deadline of January 20th.  
 
COUNTY MANAGER’S RECOMMENDATION / BOARD ACTION REQUESTED: 
 
As the Board is aware, the County’s Board of Elections has recommended the 
purchase of equipment from ES&S and the County’s Finance Director has provided 
cost and financing estimates for this equipment as requested by the Board of 
Commissioners.  Although I agree with the intent of the legislation within Senate Bill 
223 for improving accountability in elections, I am concerned with the short 
timeframe in which the County must make such an important and costly decision 
about voting equipment.  It should be noted that there has a considerable amount of 
informal discussion at legislative level concerning this issue.  Hopefully, we will have 
more information by January 18th and will be able to make a thoughtful 
recommendation in relation to this extremely important issue. 
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